RESOLUTION NO. 2014-421

A RESOLUTION AWARDING OPEN-END CONTRACTS FOR THE FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF GROUPED WAREHOUSE MATERIALS #2014-B FOR THE VINELAND MUNICIPAL ELECTRIC UTILITY – DISTRIBUTION DIVISION, ON AN INDIVIDUAL LINE ITEM BASIS TO THE RESPECTIVE LOW BIDDERS AS PROVIDED IN THE SPECIFICATIONS.

WHEREAS, the City of Vineland has heretofore advertised for bids for the furnishing and delivery of Grouped Warehouse Materials #2014-B for the Vineland Municipal Electric Utility – Distribution Division, for a period of one year from date of award, with an option for a second year, in accordance with specifications on file in the office of the Purchasing Agent; and

WHEREAS, on August 12, 2014, bids were received, duly opened and read aloud, being referred to the Business Administrator for tabulation, evaluation, report and recommendation; and

WHEREAS, the Business Administrator has, under date of October 7, 2014, submitted a written report and tabulation of the bids received and has recommended that open-end contracts for the furnishing and delivery of Grouped Warehouse Materials #2014-B for the Vineland Municipal Electric Utility – Distribution Division, be awarded on an individual line item basis to the respective low bidders as provided in the specifications as follows:

Groups A (partial award), B, D, E-1, E-3, F, G, H-1 (partial award), H-2, I (partial award), J (partial award), M, N, O (partial award), P, Q — Estimated Total \$31,646.85 HD Supply, New Castle, DE

<u>Groups C, E-2, I (partial award)</u>, & J (partial award) – Estimated Total \$4,813.60 WESCO Distribution, Richmond, VA

<u>Groups K, L, O (partial award), – Estimated Total</u> \$4,722.00 Rumsey Electric, Conshohocken, PA

said bids being the respective lowest bids received and considered in the best interest of the City of Vineland; now, therefore,

BE IT RESOLVED by the Council of the City of Vineland that said open-end contracts for the furnishing and delivery of Grouped Warehouse Materials #2014-B for the Vineland Municipal Electric Utility – Distribution Division, for a period of one year from date of award, with an option for a second year, be and the same is awarded on an individual line item basis to the respective low bidders as provided in the specifications, as stated above, said bids being the respective lowest bids received and considered in the best interest of the City of Vineland, and the Purchasing Agent be and the same is hereby authorized and directed to issue purchase order contract for the same in behalf of the City; and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the City Comptroller has certified that the funds for the contracts to be awarded herein are available.

Adopted:	
ATTEST:	President of Council
City Clerk	



October 7, 2014

REPORT TO: THE MAYOR AND COUNCIL

RE: Proposals Submitted to the Purchasing Board 8/12 & 9/23/14

Dear Mayor and Members of Council:

Submitted to you herewith for your consideration is our evaluation of the proposals submitted to the Purchasing Board on August 12 and September 29, 2014.

FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF GROUPED WAREHOUSE MATERIALS #2014-B FOR THE VINELAND MUNICIPAL ELECTRIC UTILITY – DISTRIBUTION DIVISION, FOR A PERIOD OF ONE YEAR FROM DATE OF AWARD, WITH AN OPTION FOR A SECOND YEAR

It is the recommendation of the Director of Municipal Utilities, which has the concurrence of the Assistant Business Administrator and the Purchasing Agent that an open-end contract be awarded on an individual line item basis to the respective low bidders as provided in the specifications as follows:

Groups A (partial award), B, D, E-1, E-3, F, G, H-1 (partial award), H-2, I (partial award), J (partial award), M, N, O (partial award), P, Q - Estimated Total \$31,646.85 HD Supply, New Castle, DE

Groups C, E-2, I (partial award), & J (partial award) – Estimated Total \$4,813.60 WESCO Distribution, Richmond, VA

Groups K, L, O (partial award),—Estimated Total \$4,722.00

Rumsey Electric, Conshohocken, PA

COMPLETE DEMOLITION OF BUILDINGS – 627-629 E. ELMER STREET

It is the recommendation of a committee consisting of the Assistant Business Administrator, Director of L & I, Director of Economic Development and General Supervisor of Buildings, which has the concurrence of the Purchasing Agent that a contract be awarded to the low bidder, EarthTech Contracting, Inc., Greenfield, NJ, in the amount of \$56,237.00.

We trust that the above recommendation will receive your favorable consideration and that the recommended resolutions will be adopted as presented.

Respectfully submitted,

MweeMyracu Denise Monaco

Assistant Business Administrator



BID EVALUATION FORM

BID EVALUATION FORM	DECEMENT
DEPARTMENT Vineland Electric Utility	RECEIVED
	SEP 1 6 2014
Date: 09/11/2014	CITY OF VINELAND BUSINESS ADMIN.
The undersigned recommends that a contract be awarded for the following	g:
1. Bid Title: Open-End Contract for Grouped Warehouse Materials	2014-B
2. Amount to be Awarded: \$\frac{\$41,182.45}{}\$ (This represents an "Estima"	ted Total Award" only.)
Encumber Total Award	
Encumber by Supplemental Release	
3. Engineer's Estimate: \$51,000.00	
4. Amount Budget: \$\frac{N/A}{}	
5. Account Number to be Charged: <u>002-0-00-0000-2-1540000</u>	
6. Date Bids Received: 08/12/2014	
7. Date to be Awarded: 10/14/2014	
8. Recommended Vendor: Split Award (See Recommendation Deta	il)
9. Is Recommended Vendor the Apparent Lowest Bidder?	No
10. Comments/Special Instructions:	1/1/4 9/11/19
11. Evaluation Performed by: Dexter L. Gordon	Sperforth 4/11/14
12. Approved By: J. Ble gliffy M. July	la
13. Attached: (Check-Off List)	
 ☐ Tabulation of Bids ✓ Justification for Vendor Recommendation (if applicable) ✓ Evaluation Data (if applicable) 	

Send copies to:
Purchasing Division Business Administration

TABULATION OF BIDS GROUPED WAREHOUSE MATERIALS 2014-B

AUGUST 12, 2014

Engineer's estimate - \$51,000

Engineer's est	Rumsey Electric Co	Stuart C Irby	HD Power Supply	WESCO Distribution BUSINE
	15 Colwell Lane	4583 Buckely Rd	Solutions	2902 North Boulevard
	Conshohocken PA	Liverpool NY	51 Steel Drive	Richmond VA
		***	New Castle DE	
BB CAC CEC	BB 10%	BB 10%	BB 10%	BB 10%
Stock Discl	YES	NONE	YES *	YES
Aff Action	YES	YES	YES	YES
Check List	YES	YES	YES	YES
Proposal	YES	YES	YES	YES
Iran Discl	YES	YES	YES	YES
Group A	\$1,763.80		\$1,706.48	\$2,088.72
Group B	No Bid		\$3,198.00	\$3,449.50
Group C	No Bid		\$359.00	\$165.00
Group D	No Bid		\$254.00	\$303.50
Group E-1	No Bid		\$1,444.00	\$1,480.00
Group E-2	No Bid		\$483.90	\$478.10
Group E-3	No Bid		\$348.50	\$373.00
Group F	No Bid	340	\$693.00	\$711.88
Group G	\$5,011.20		\$3,714.69	\$3,901.29
Group H-1	\$2,183.90		\$1,679.70	No Bid
Group H-2	\$934.08		\$609.60	\$145.44
Group I	No Bid		\$2,892.94	\$3,447.84
Group J	No Bid		\$6,898.80	\$8,898.20
Group K	\$1,044.00		\$1,339.00	\$1,048.00
Group L	\$3,005.00		\$3,121.00	\$3,146.00
Group M	No Bid		\$7,034.27	\$9,597.25
Group N	No Bid		\$3,462.72	\$3,669.60
Group O	\$673.00		\$1,264.10	\$1,673.15
Group P	No Bid		\$204.35	\$69.70
Group Q	\$540.00		\$388.20	\$417.90
TOTAL	\$15,154.98	\$45,447.56	\$41,096.25	\$45,064.07
	(corrected total)	(as read)	(corrected total)	(corrected total)
	(not all items)	(not all items)	(not all items)	(not all items)

^{***} Automatic rejection. Blank stockholder disclosure certification submitted. Required by State law.

Specifications also received by the following:

GM Sales

Shanahan & Associates

Mutual Screw & Supply Martini & Associates

Graybar Electric

Mid-Atlantic Power

Project summary on Sheet 2

^{*} Not notarized. Email was sent to company for correction.

This specification is an open ended contract for various newly manufactured distribution								
materials, minimum order will be specified as initial quantities and will be ordered at the time								
of award. Additional quantities will be ordered on an as needed basis in quantities of at least								
the minimum re-	order quantit	y specified	for each r	naterial typ	e.			

for

Open Ended Specification for Grouped Warehouse Material #2014-B

Cuoun A Hon	Award To:	Item #	Manufacturer	Catalog #	Unit Pricing	Estimated Award
Group A iter	ms - Adapters		- Group Award o	n items quoted.		
	HD Supply	103-001	Penn Union	FT-4-037	16.21	\$194.52
	HD Supply	103-002	T&B	CEA4-50	20.71	\$414.20
	HD Supply	103-003		NO BID		\$0.00
	HD Supply	103-004	T&B	CEA4-75	23.36	\$560.64
	HD Supply	103-005	Burndy	FBC654N	32.74	\$196.44
	HD Supply	103-010	T&B / Homac	TSC4-8-TN	56.78	\$340.68

Delivery: MFG Stock - 4 wks

How long is pricing firm?: 1 year

Is Option Year Pricing being offered: No

Option Year Pricing: Will re-evaluate

Special Note - No qualified bidders quoted item #103-003.

Group B Items	- Anchors & A	ccessories		Group Award		
<u> </u>	ID Supply	115-001	HPS	E1021633	20.08	\$1,004.00
_	ID Supply	115-002	Dixie	D84-2-6	45.80	\$916.00
<u> </u>	ID Supply	115-010	Dixie	D75	13.87	\$693.50
F	ID Supply	115-011	Dixie	D7531/2C	17.77	\$177.70
	ID Supply	115-020	HPS	6562	6.02	\$301.00
<u> </u>	ID Supply	115-021	Dixie	D6567	5.29	\$105.80

Delivery: MFG Stock - 6 wks

How long is pricing firm?: 1 year

Is Option Year Pricing being offered: No

Option Year Pricing: Will re-evaluate

Group C Items - 3/8" Hardwa	are	- Group Award			-
Wesco	199-031	Victory Bolt	3816412	0.24	\$24.00
Wesco	199-052	Victory Bolt	381616	0.30	\$30.00
Wesco	199-053	Victory Bolt	38168	0.38	\$38.00
Wesco	199-054	Victory Bolt	38160	0.47	\$47.00
Wesco	591-013	Victory Bolt	3816	0.21	\$21.00
Wesco	956-001	Victory Bolt	38USS	0.05	\$5.00

Delivery: Stock Subject to Prior Sale / 1 - 2 wks

How long is pricing firm?: Prices are intended to be firm to Aug 30, 2015

Is Option Year Pricing being offered: Yes

Option Year Pricing: Prices to be review for second year.

Tab: Recommendation #2014-B Filename: Grouped Material #2014-B



Recommendation Detail

for

Page 2 of 18

Open Ended Specification for Grouped Warehouse Material #2014-B

	Award To:	Item #	Manufacturer	Catalog #	Unit Pricing	Estimated Award
Group D Item	s - 1/2" Hardwa	re	- Group Award			
_	HD Supply	199-006	MPS	J8706	0.75	\$75.00
	HD Supply	199-008	HPS	8708	0.95	\$95.00
_	HD Supply	199-009	MPS	J8710	1.12	\$56.00
_	HD Supply	591-010	HPS	55083P	0.20	\$20.00
<u>_l</u>	HD Supply	956-002	MPS	J1086	0.08	\$8.00

Delivery: MFG Stock - 4 wks

How long is pricing firm?: 1 year

Is Option Year Pricing being offered: No

Option Year Pricing: Will re-evaluate

Group E-1 Items - 5/8" Hardy	vare	Group Award			
HD Supply	199-081	MPS	J8808	0.87	\$174.00
HD Supply	199-010	MPS	J8810	0.92	\$552.00
HD Supply	199-012	MPS	J8812	1.01	\$202.00
HD Supply	199-014	MPS	J8814	1.17	\$234.00
HD Supply	199-016	MPS	J8816	1.41	\$282.00

Delivery : MFG Stock - 3 wks (HD Stock)

How long is pricing firm?: 1 year

Is Option Year Pricing being offered: No

Option Year Pricing: Will re-evaluate

Group E-2 Items - 5/8" Ha	rdware	Group Award	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·		
Wesco	199-116	Victory Bolt	581116	2.27	\$56.75
Wesco	199-118	Victory Bolt	581118	2.32	\$58.00
Wesco	199-120	Victory Bolt	581120	2.46	\$61.50
Wesco	199-122	Victory Bolt	581122	2.65	\$66.25
Wesco	199-124	Victory Bolt	581124	2.84	\$71.00
Wesco	199-126	Victory Bolt	581126	3.08	\$61.60
Wesco	199-128	Victory Bolt	581128	3.22	\$64.40
Wesco	199-132	Victory Bolt	581132	3.86	\$38.60

Delivery : Stock Subject to Prior Sale / 1 - 2 wks

How long is pricing firm?: Prices are intended to be firm to Aug 30, 2015

Is Option Year Pricing being offered: Yes

Option Year Pricing: Prices to be review for second year.

Tab: Recommendation #2014-B Filename: Grouped Material #2014-B Old

Recommendation Detail

for

Open Ended Specification for Grouped Warehouse Material #2014-B

	ward To:	Item#	Manufacturer	Catalog #	Unit Pricing	Estimated Award
Group E-3 Items	s - 5/8" Hardv	vare	Group Award			
<u>H(</u>	D Supply	199-001	MPS	J9412	2.36	\$118.00
<u>H(</u>	D Supply	591-001	MPS	6510	2.12	\$106.00
<u>H</u> (O Supply	591-004	MPS	J1092	1.59	\$79.50
<u>H</u>	O Supply	591-011	MPS	J8563	0.20	\$20.00
Н	O Supply	956-003	HPS	6813	0.25	\$25.00

Delivery : MFG Stock - 4 wks

How long is pricing firm?: 1 year

Is Option Year Pricing being offered: No

Option Year Pricing: Will re-evaluate

Group Filtems - 3/4"	Hardware	Group Award			
HD Sup	ply 199-310	MPS	J8910	1.93	\$48.25
HD Sup	ply 199-312	MPS	J8912	1.79	\$44.75
HD Sup	ply 199-314	MPS	J8914	2.20	\$55.00
HD Sup	ply 199-316	MPS	J8916	2.17	\$54.25
HD Sup	ply 199-318	MPS	J8918	2.50	\$62.50
HD Sup		HPS	29982	6.99	\$174.75
HD Sup		MPS	J1093	1.71	\$85.50
HD Sup	ply 591-012	MPS	J8564	0.42	\$42.00
HD Sup	ply 956-004	MPS	J6823	0.76	\$76.00
HD Sup		MPS	J1076	0.24	\$24.00
HD Sup	ply 956-007	MPS	J1089	0.26	\$26.00

Delivery: MFG Stock - 4 wks

How long is pricing firm?: 1 year

Is Option Year Pricing being offered: No

Option Year Pricing: Will re-evaluate

Group G Items - Switches		Group Award			
HD Supply	347-011	Aluma-Form	HPS-600A-155-110-AS-1A	146.38	\$878.28
HD Supply	347-012	Bridges	660T	463.04	\$1,389.12
HD Supply	347-013	Aluma-Form	HPS-900A-155-110-AS-1A	160.81	\$1,447.29

Delivery: MFG Stock - 8 wks

How long is pricing firm?: 1 year

Is Option Year Pricing being offered: No

Option Year Pricing: Will re-evaluate

Tab: Recommendation #2014-B Filename: Grouped Material #2014-B OB

for

Open Ended Specification for Grouped Warehouse Material #2014-B

				Unit	Estimated
Award To:	Item #	Manufacturer	Catalog #	Pricing	Award
Group H-1 Items - Fuses		Group Award on ite	ems quoted.		
HD Supply	422-001	Cooper Bussman	oper Bussman FRN-R-1/2		\$78.20
HD Supply	422-002	THE REAL PROPERTY AND ADDRESS OF THE PARTY AND	NO BID		\$0.00
HD Supply	422-003	Cooper Bussman	FRN-R-1	3.61	\$72.20
HD Supply	422-004	The same of the sa	NO BID		\$0.00
HD Supply	422-005	Cooper Bussman	FRN-R-2	3.47	\$69.40
HD Supply	422-006		NO BID		\$0.00
HD Supply	422-007	Cooper Bussman	FRN-R-5	3.17	\$63.40
HD Supply	422-008		NO BID		\$0.00
HD Supply	422-009	Cooper Bussman	FRN-R10	3.17	\$95.10
HD Supply	422-010	Cooper Bussman	FRN-R15	2.54	\$76.20
HD Supply	422-011	Cooper Bussman	FRN-R20	2.54	\$76.20
HD Supply	422-012	Cooper Bussman	FRN-R30	2.54	\$76.20
HD Supply	422-013	Cooper Bussman	FRN-R45	4.65	\$139.50
HD Supply	422-014	Cooper Bussman	FRN-R60	4.65	\$139.50
HD Supply	422-015	Cooper Bussman	FRN-R100	10.47	\$314.10
HD Supply	422-016	Cooper Bussman	FRN-R35	4.65	\$139.50
HD Supply	422-017	Cooper Bussman	KTK-20	5.68	\$170.40
HD Supply	422-018	Cooper Bussman	KTK-5	5.66	\$169.80

Delivery: MFG Stock - 6 wks

How long is pricing firm?: 1 year

Is Option Year Pricing being offered: No

Option Year Pricing: Will re-evaluate

Special Note - No qualified bidders quoted items #422-002, #422-004, #422-006, & #422-008.

Group I	H-2 Items - Fuses		Group Award	THE STREET WAS DESCRIBED AND ADDRESS OF THE PARTY OF THE		
	HD Supply	422-050	Cooper Bussman	T30	2.52	\$120.96
	HD Supply	422-051	Cooper Bussman	S20	2.57	\$123.36
	HD Supply	422-052	Cooper Bussman	S30	2.57	\$123.36
	HD Supply	422-053	Cooper Bussman	T15	2.52	\$120.96
	HD Supply	422-054	Cooper Bussman	T20	2.52	\$120.96

Delivery : MFG Stock - 6 wks

How long is pricing firm?: 1 year

Is Option Year Pricing being offered: No

Option Year Pricing: Will re-evaluate

Tab: Recommendation #2014-B Filename: Grouped Material #2014-B Of the

for

Open Ended Specification for Grouped Warehouse Material #2014-B

				Unit	Estimated
Award	To: Item #	Manufacturer	Catalog #	Pricing	Award
Group I Items - Insu	lators	Split Award			
Wesco	507-010	Procelain Products	263S	3.63	\$1,633.50
HD Sur	oply 507-021	HPS	5110041301	80.49	\$482.94
Wesco	507-022	Hubbell	4010150215	7.95	\$795.00
HD Sup	oply 507-050	HPS	31144	3.27	\$163.50
Wesco	507-051	Hubbell	C2070138	2.65	\$265.00

Wesco

Stock Subject to Prior Sale

HPS for 507-022 = 3 - 5 wks / 507-051 = 2 - 4 wks

Delivery : Procelain Products = 4 - 6 wks

Prices are intended to be firm to

How long is pricing firm?: Hubbell = Dec 31, 2014 / Procelain Products = ?

Is Option Year Pricing being offered: Yes

Option Year Pricing: Prices to be review for second year.

HD Supply

Delivery: MFG Stock - 8 wks

How long is pricing firm?: 1 year

Is Option Year Pricing being offered: No

Option Year Pricing: Will re-evaluate

OB

Tab: Recommendation #2014-B Filename: Grouped Material #2014-B

Recommendation Detail

Open Ended Specification for Grouped Warehouse Material #2014-B

				Unit	Estimated
Award T	o: Item#	Manufacturer	Catalog #	Pricing	Award
Group J Items - Prim	ary Fuse Links	Split Award			THE RESERVE AND ADDRESS OF THE PARTY OF THE
HD Sup	oly 558-005	CPS	FL3K6	2.17	\$434.00
HD Sup	oly 558-006	CPS	FL3K10	2.07	\$414.00
HD Sup	oly 558-007	CPS	FL3K15	2.07	\$414.00
HD Sup	oly 558-008	CPS	FL3K25	2.15	\$430.00
HD Sup		CPS	FL3K40	2.50	\$500.00
HD Sup	oly 558-010	HPS	M65KA23	4.45	\$890.00
HD Sup	oly 558-011	HPS	M100KA23	4.99	\$998.00
Wesco	558-012	Hubbell	M140KA23T	14.77	\$1,477.00
HD Sup	oly 558-013	HPS	M200KA23T	19.53	\$1,171.80
HD Supp	oly 558-015	CPS	FL3K50	2.61	\$261.00
HD Supp	oly 558-051	CPS	FL3T20	2.58	\$51.60
HD Supp	oly 558-052	CPS	FL3T25	2.86	\$114.40

Wesco

Delivery: Stock Subject to Prior Sale Hubbell = 4 - 6 wks

How long is pricing firm?: Prices are intended to be firm to Dec 31, 2014

Is Option Year Pricing being offered: Yes

Option Year Pricing: Prices to be review for second year.

HD Supply

Delivery: MFG Stock - 6 wks

How long is pricing firm?: 1 year

Is Option Year Pricing being offered: No

Option Year Pricing: Will re-evaluate

Group K Items - Lugs		- Group Av	vard		
Rumsey	567-050	T&B	SA 4-48	0.93	\$93.00
Rumsey	567-051	T&B	SA 2-48	0.99	\$99.00
Rumsey	567-052	T&B	SA1/0-48	0.83	\$166.00
Rumsey	567-053	T&B	SA2/0-48	1.08	\$108.00
Rumsey	567-054	T&B	SA3/0-48	1.55	\$155.00
Rumsey	567-055	T&B	SA4/0-48	1.06	\$212.00
Rumsey	567-056	T&B	SAKM350-48	2.11	\$211.00

Exceptions:

Freight allowed amounts per manufacturer are as follows - T&B (Thomas & Betts) - \$2,800

Delivery: Stock - 8 wks ARO

How long is pricing firm?: 08-31-2015

Is Option Year Pricing being offered: Yes

Option Year Pricing: Max 15% increase

Tab: Recommendation #2014-B Filename: Grouped Material #2014-B

Recommendation Detail

for

Open Ended Specification for Grouped Warehouse Material #2014-B

Award To:	Item #	Manufacturer	Catalog #	Unit Pricing	Estimated Award
Group L Items - Photo Controls		Group Award			
Rumsey	570-032	Acquity Brands / DTL	DP124-1.5-TJJ	4.94	\$988.00
Rumsey	570-035	Acquity Brands / DTL	DP124-1.5-TJ-J50	4.77	\$477.00
Rumsey	570-037	Acquity Brands / DTL	DSS124F-1.5-TJJE-J50	15.40	\$1,540.00

Exceptions:

Freight allowed amounts per manufacturer are as follows - Acquity - \$1,200

Delivery: Stock - 6 wks ARO

How long is pricing firm?: 08-31-2015

Is Option Year Pricing being offered: Yes

Option Year Pricing: Max 15% increase

Group M Items - Equipment	Mounts	Group Award			
HD Supply	587-001	MPS	MDM-2M2	49.78	\$995.60
HD Supply	587-002	AlumaForm	DM-4M2	91.67	\$1,833.40
HD Supply	587-003	AlumaForm	3MW-24-AB	136.98	\$821.88
HD Supply	587-005	Barfield	BAPMM6	244.87	\$734.61
HD Supply	587-006	MPS	MHD2PAL-16	1707.68	\$1,707.68
HD Supply	587-008	MPS	MDM-4M2	94.11	\$941.10

Delivery: MFG Stock - 8 wks

How long is pricing firm?: 1 year

Is Option Year Pricing being offered: No

Option Year Pricing: Will re-evaluate

Group N It	ems - Primary Insi	ulator Pins	Group Award			
	HD Supply	609-001	HPS	884	4.21	\$1,263.00
	HD Supply	609-002	MPS	G1MDT115DG2	23.12	\$1,156.00
	HD Supply	609-003	MPS	J7402	6.79	\$543.20
	HD Supply	609-004	HPS	PS8779	11.68	\$233.60
	HD Supply	609-006	FLAGG/MPS	P403	32.97	\$197.82
	HD Supply	609-010	HPS	DP1L2	6.91	\$69.10

Delivery: MFG Stock - 8 wks

How long is pricing firm?: 1 year

Is Option Year Pricing being offered: No

Option Year Pricing: Will re-evaluate

Tab: Recommendation #2014-B Filename: Grouped Material #2014-B Gordon 114

for

Open Ended Specification for Grouped Warehouse Material #2014-B

Award To:	Item #	Manufacturer	Catalog #	Unit Pricing	Estimated Award
Group O Items - Terminations	- URD Prima	ry	Split Award		
HD Supply	789-030	3M	5411R	86.72	\$433.60
HD Supply	789-031	3M	5411-CI-21	30.10	\$150.50
Rumsey	789-060	T&B	R2T15J1-T0-220	33.65	\$673.00

Rumsey

Exceptions:

Freight allowed amounts per manufacturer are as follows - T&B (Thomas & Betts) - \$2,800

Delivery: Stock - 8 wks ARO

How long is pricing firm?: 08-31-2015

Is Option Year Pricing being offered: Yes

Option Year Pricing: Max 15% increase

HD Supply

Delivery: MFG Stock - 8 wks

How long is pricing firm?: 1 year

Is Option Year Pricing being offered: No

Option Year Pricing: Will re-evaluate

Group P Items - Splices - UR	D Secondary -		Group Award		
HD Supply	789-032	Raychem	GIL-4/0	12.39	\$61.95
HD Supply	789-035	3M	CI-T-4	7.12	\$142.40

Delivery: MFG Stock - 4 wks

How long is pricing firm?: 1 year

Is Option Year Pricing being offered: No

Option Year Pricing: Will re-evaluate

Group Q Items - Termination	- URD Second	dary	Group Award		-
HD Supply	870-005	Polaris	PSMTLLC350-6SSLP	12.94	\$388.20

Delivery: MFG Stock - 6 wks

How long is pricing firm?: 1 year

Is Option Year Pricing being offered: No

Option Year Pricing: Will re-evaluate

Awarded to Estimated Award
Rumsey Electric - \$4,722.00
HD Supply Power Solutions - \$31,646.85
Wesco Electric - \$4,813.60

Estimated Total Award

\$41,182.45

Tab: Recommendation #2014-B Filename: Grouped Material #2014-B

